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Notice is hereby given that pursuant 
to sections 1412, 1414, 1415 and 1450 of 
the Safe Drinking Water Act (“the Act,” 
Pub. L. 93-523) the Administrator of the 
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA) 
proposes to issue a new 40 C7FR Part 141 
setting forth interim primary drinking 
water standards (Subpart A) and regu¬ 
lations governing the granting of 
variances and exemptions from those 
standards (Subpart B). The pr(^>osed 
regulations set forth below cover only 
the interim primary standards. Proposed 
regulations dealing with the granting of 
variances and exemptions will be pub¬ 
lished shortly. 

The Act was signed by the President 
on December 16, 1974. It is the first Fed¬ 
eral Act dealing in depth with providing 
safe drinking water for public use. The 
standards proposed today are the first 
regulati(ms to be published as part of 
EPA’s implementation of this new major 
environmental legislation. Under section 
1412(a)(1) of the Act, EPA is oUigated 
to publish proposed standards within 90 
days after enactment, and promulgation 
of final standards is required 180 days 
after enactment. Those standards be- 
cmne effective 18 months after the date 
of their promulgation. 

The Act clearly contemplates that the 
States, rather than the P^eral govern¬ 
ment, will have primary responsibilities 
for carrying out the purposes of the legis¬ 
lation. Thus, when a State demonstrates 
that it has the authority and capability 
to carry on a program consistent with 
the Act, the Federal government will 
recognize the State’s primary enforce¬ 
ment responsibilities and will thereafter 
play largely a passive role in assuring 
safe drinking water in that State. Under 
section 1413(a) (1) of the Act a Estate has 
primary enforcement responsibility if the 
Administrator has determined that such 
State— 

(1) Has adc^ted drinking water regu¬ 
lations which 

(A) In the case of the period begin¬ 
ning on the date the National Interim 
Primary Drinking Water Regulations are 
promulgated under section 1412 and 
ending on the date such regulations take 
effect are no less stringent than such 
regulations, and 

(B) In the case of the period after 
such effective date are no less stringent 
than the interim and revised national 
primary drinking water regulations in 
effect under such section; 

(2) H:as adopted and is implementing 
adequate procedures for the enforcement 
of such State regulations, including con¬ 
ducting such monitoring and making 
such inspections as the Administrator 
may require by regulation: 

(3) Will keep such records and make 
such reports with respect to its activities 
under paragr{q}hs (1) and (2) as the 
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Administrator may require by regula¬ 
tion; 

(4) If it permits variances or exemp¬ 
tions, or both, from the requirements of 
its drinking water regulations which 
meet the requirements of paragraph (1), 
permits such variances and exemptions 
under conditions and in a manner which 
is not less stringent than the .conditions 
under, and the manner in, which vari¬ 
ances and exemptions may be granted 
under sections 1415 and 1416; and 

(5) Has adopted and can implement 
an adequate plan for the provision of 
safe drinking water under emergency 
circumstances. 

The Administrator shall, by regula¬ 
tion (proposed within 180 days of the 
date of the enactment of the Act, pre¬ 
scribe the manner in which a State may 
apply to the Administrator for a deter¬ 
mination that the requirements of para- 
grai^ (1), (2), (3), and (4) of subsec¬ 
tion (a) of section 1413 of the Act are 
satisfied with respect to the State, the 
manner in which the determination is 
made, the period for which the deter¬ 
mination will be effective, and the man¬ 
ner in which the Administrator may de¬ 
termine that such requirements are no 
longer met. Such regulations shall re¬ 
quire that before a determination of the 
Administrator that such requirements 
are met or are no longer met with re¬ 
spect to a State may become effective, 
the Administrator shall notify such 
State of the determination and the rea¬ 
sons therefor and shall provide an opr>or- 
timity for public hearing on the deter¬ 
mination. Such regulations shall be 
promulgated (with such modifications as 
the Administrator deems appropriate) 
within 90 days of the publication of the 
proposed regulations in the Federal Reg¬ 
ister. Ihe Administrator shall promptly 
notify in writing the chief executive 
oflBcer of each State of the promulgation 
of regulations under this paragraph. 
Such notice shall contain a copy of the 
regulations and shall specify a State’s 
authority under this title when it is de¬ 
termined to have primary enforcement 
responsibility for public waiter systems. 

(2) When am application is submitted 
in au;cordance with the Administrator’s 
regulations, the Administrator shall 
within 90 days of the date on which such 
application is submitted 

(A) Madce the determination applied 
for, or 

(B) Deny the application and notify 
the applicimt in writing of the reasons 
for his denial. 

Within 180 days affter enau^tment EPA 
is required to propose regulations which 
prescribe the manner in which a State 
may aqiply to the Administrator for a de¬ 
termination that it hais met the criteria 
for (Hieration of a saffe drinking water 
prograun. 

A principal concern of EPA in deter¬ 
mining the scope, stringency, and timing 
of the proposed interim drinking water 
regulidions is the burden they will im¬ 
pose aind its implications for the work- 
aibility of the regulations. The Act ais- 
signs a predominant role to the States. 
EPA recognizes that decisions to imple¬ 
ment these regulations on the part of 

most States must be a reaisonable prob¬ 
ability. The willing cooperation of sub¬ 
ordinate levels of government, public 
utilities amd others is adso necessary. In 
this regard, commenters are urged to 
keep in mind the levels of dollar re¬ 
sources and other aissistance that can be 
expected from EPA to support States, 
local government amd other participants 
in carrying out the Act. EPA’s budget 
request for gramts to States for public 
water system supervision programs in 
FY 1976 is $7,500,000. EPA personnel re¬ 
sources and other flnanciad resources will 
be made available, particulairly to aissist 
the States in setting up amd operating 
programs, to the extent possible, but this 
support will necessarily be limited and 
the States and utilities will need to allo¬ 
cate funds to implement the prograun. 

EPA hais provided for phasing in the 
testing requirements in the presently 
proposed regulations. In its regulations 
governing the requirements for State 
programs to qualify for primary enforce¬ 
ment respon^ility EPA will allow con¬ 
siderable leeway in the time-phaising of 
programs, and will permit considerable 
variation and flexibility in State ap¬ 
proaches to enforcement. Even so, mamy 
impau;ts amd duties will fall upon the 
States as soon aus these regulations are 
effective eighteen months after promul¬ 
gation. Enforcement requests and citizms 
suits must be anticipated to commence 
then. Cadis for State aissistance to locali¬ 
ties and utilities, including extensive 
laboratory services and approval of ladi- 
oratories, aLssistance in upgrading per¬ 
formance and other services, will esca¬ 
late. Violations of the regulations by 
suppliers of water will become immedi- 
iately appau'ent with the operation of 
section 1414(c) of the Act and § 141.32 
of the regulations ais to public notifica¬ 
tion. A flow of ai^lications for variances 
amd exemptions will begin. 

With these considerations in mind, yet 
recognizing the overriding consideration 
of improving protection of public health 
through assuring compliance with the 
standards set forth in these regulations, 
EPA must fix the maucimum contauninant 
levels and other requirements cadled fan* 
in the interim regulations. On the many 
aispects of this most important issue in¬ 
volving the appropriate balance of health 
protection and realistic implementation 
of the prograun, EPA requests public 
analysis amd comment. 

The Interim Primary Drinking Water 
Standards proposed today protect health 
to the extent feaisible, taking costs into 
consideration, using technology, treat¬ 
ment techniques amd other means gen¬ 
erally avadlable. The Act in section 1401 
requires that for eaudi primary drinking 
water contaminant the Administrator 
specify either a maximum contaminant 
level if it is feasible to ascertain that level 
in water, or, a treatment technique which 

.leads to a sufficient reduction in the level 
of such contaminant if It is not feaisible 
to ascertadn that level. Based on past 
monitoring experience for these levels, 
the Administrator has determined that 
it is economically and technologically 
feasible to monitor drinking water for 
contauninants at the maximum contami- 
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nant levels. Therefore, required treat¬ 
ment techniques will not he a part of 
these interim primary standards. How¬ 
ever, EPA welcomes comment on this is¬ 
sue and if public comment justifies it, 
EPA will consider issuing treatment tech¬ 
niques in Ueu of maximum contaminant 
levels for one or more of the contami¬ 
nants covered in the regulations. 

The interim primary standards pro¬ 
posed today are based largely on the 1962 
Public Health Service Drinking Waiter 
Standards and the review of those stand¬ 
ards accomplished by the EPA Advisory 
Committee Report on the Revision ami 
Application of the Drinking Water 
Standards, as reamimended to the Ad- 
ministraitor, on September 20, 1973. 

The Act in section 1412(b) provides 
that revised primary drinking water 
standards are to proposed (and 
promulgated within 180 days thereafter) 
100 days f<^owing the date of the report 
on the study to be conducted by the Na¬ 
tional Academy Sciences on recom¬ 
mended health-based maximum con¬ 
taminant levels. This report is due no 
later than December 16, 1976. In turn, 
the revised primary regulations will be 
effective 18 months following the date of 
their promulgation. While it is antici¬ 
pated that changes will be made in some 
of the maximum contaminant levels of 
the interim primary standards, that 
there will be contaminants added to the 
Ust of regulated substances, and that 
broad groupings of contaminants (such 
as organics) will be further defined, the 
revised standards will not automatically 
supersede the interim standards. Only if 
the revised regulations expressly revoke 
the interim standards will the latter no 
longer be effective. In determining 
whether the revised regulations will su¬ 
persede, the Administrator will consider 
the length of time they have been in ef¬ 
fect, and the compatibility of the cconpll- 
ance strategies and techniques for meet¬ 
ing interim and revised regulations. If all 
or part of the interim regulations remain 
in effect, the water supplier will be re¬ 
quired to meet both sets of standards 
sequentially. 

DeAnitions and coverage. To determine 
whether these standards apply to a par¬ 
ticular system, reference must be made 
to both S§ 141.2 and 141.3 of the regula¬ 
tions. The term “public water system” is 
defined in 4 141.2(e) to mean a system 
which serves at least fifteen service con¬ 
nections or at least twenty-five individ¬ 
uals on a regular basis. Public water 
systems which otherwise would be cov¬ 
ered by the Act are not required to meet 
these standards if they serve 25 or more 
people but only for less than three 
months out of the year. The intent is to 
cover campgrounds and resort facilities 
which may serve for at least three 
months a substantial population. Al¬ 
though a supplier of drinking water must 
comply with all requirements of the Act 
when he is providing water, he need not 
monitor, make reports, etc., while the 
system is not operating or when it is 
regularly providing water to fewer than 
twenty-five individuals. 

For a pitolic water system to be ex¬ 
cluded from coverage by these regula¬ 
tions it must meet sdl four criteria set out 
by 1141.3. 

The broad definition of “State” in 
f 141.2(f) is intended to make clear that 
the State govenunent is the primary en¬ 
forcement authority if the State has as¬ 
sumed this authority imder section 1413 
of the Act; if not, the Regional Adminis¬ 
trator of EPA is the primary enforce¬ 
ment authority. The only excepti<m is 
found in i 141.31 (Repo^ng Require¬ 
ments), where the Federal Agencies are 
required to report results of anal3rses to 
the Regional Administrator even when 
the State has assumed primary enforce¬ 
ment responsibility. 

Maximum contaminant levels. The 
maximum contaminant levels for Ar¬ 
senic. Barium, Cadmium, Chromimn, 
Cyanide, Fluoride, Lead, Selenliun and 
Silver are identical to the 1962 Drinking 
Water Standards (section 5.22). With the 
exception of nitrates, all of the maximum 
contaminant levels for inorganic chemi¬ 
cals are based upon data addressed to 
possible health effects that may occm 
after a lifetime of exposure, and the 
standards have been reviewed in light of 
substantial information generated since 
the publication of the 1962 Standards. 
More complete siunmaries of the bases 
for these standards are contained in the 
Statement of Basis and Purpose. 

Special attention is invited to the 
cadmium standard. Recent evidence has 
established that cigarette smoking may 
contribute as much or more cadmium to 
the body burden as does the ingestion of 
cadmium with food. The standard for 
cadmium proposed today does not take 
into account the additive effect of cad¬ 
mium ingestion from smoking. EPA in¬ 
vites comments as to the question 
whether the cadmium standard ^ould 
be directed specifically toward protection 
of smokers as well as non-smokers. 

Only a small fraction of the mercury 
in drinking water is in the alkyl form, 
which is considered more toxic than other 
forms of mercury. Alkyl mercury has 
only been detected in water in the nan¬ 
ogram per liter range. However, the pro¬ 
posed standard for mercury is derived 
cm the assumption that all mercury in 
water is methyl mercury- Public com¬ 
ment is solicited as to whether or not this 
procedure is reasonable. Possible alterna¬ 
tives include; 

a. Setting the standard on the assump¬ 
tion that all the mercury in the water is 
methyl meircury, but requiring that the 
total mercury concentration be below the 
specified level, 

b. Leaving the standard at the present 
level to protect against the toxic effects 
of methyl mercury, but specify that the 
standard applies only to that form, or 

c. Elstabli^ing two standards—one for 
organic and one for inorganic mercury. 

ITie maximum contaminant level for 
organic chemicals (S 141.12) is deter¬ 
mined by the Carbon (Chloroform Extract 
(CCE) procedure employing the low fiow 
Carbon Adsorption Method (CAM-low 
fiow) sampler. The present interim pri¬ 
mary standard (0.7mg/l-CAM-low fiow) 

is substantively equivalent to the 1962 
Standard (0.2 mg/1-CAM-hlgh fiow). 
The low fiow CAM sampler provides 
longer contact time between the water 
sample and the activated carbon and 
therefore, has 3V^ times greater extrac¬ 
tion efficiency. 

EPA is conducting several monitoring 
surveys (including the National Recon¬ 
naissance Survey of drinking water sup¬ 
plies mandated by the Act) to determine 
the extent of the incidence of organic 
chemicals in drinking water and associ¬ 
ated toxicity of those substances. Revised 
standards will refiect the results of those 
studies. 

The pesticide contaminants listed in 
the proposed regulations issued today 
were not contained in the 1962 Stand¬ 
ards. The maximum contaminant levels 
for these substances have been derived 
from the recent (iata on effects of acute 
and chronic exposure to both organo- 
chlorine and chlorophenoxy pesticides. 

The list of pesticide contaminants (toes 
not include Aldrin/Dieldrin and DDT 
because the Agency is presently conduct¬ 
ing an intensive nationwide siuwey to 
determine the extent of the contamina¬ 
tion of the drinking water by these per¬ 
sistent pesticides- This program is to be 
completed within the next few months, 
and subsequently the Agency will pro¬ 
pose interim primary drinking water 
standards for Aldrin/Dieldrin and DDT. 
Almost all uses of DDT were canc^ed 
under the Federal Insecticide, Fungicide 
and Rodenticide Act. 7 U.S.C. 136 et seq., 
on March 18, 1971, and the Agency has 
suspended the major uses of Aldrln/ 
Dieldrin (October 1, 1974, 39 FR 37272). 
(This suspension is presently on appeal 
to the United Statese Court of Appeals 
for the District of Columbja Circuit, Nos. 
74-1924, 74-2113, and 74-2114). A factor 
in both actions was evidence that those 
pesticides are potential carcinogens. The 
interim primary drinking water stand¬ 
ards for these chemicals will take this 
evidence of carcinogenicity into accoimt. 

The Administrator has also issued a 
notice of intent to cancel many of the 
major uses of heptachtor and chlordane, 
which are included in these standards. 
Heptachlor epoxide, though not a prod¬ 
uct directly applied as a pesticide, results 
from the use of heptachlor or chlordane. 
Preparations are underway for presenta¬ 
tion at an adjudicatory hearing the evi- 
drace relating to the carcinogenic risks 
ass(x:iated with the use of heptachlor and 
chlordane. It is anticipate that the 
maximxun contaminant levels for hep¬ 
tachlor, chlordane, and heptachlor epox¬ 
ide—which are based on chronic human 
toxicity other than carcinogenicity—^will 
be reviewed within the next several 
months and may be revised to refiect the 
cancer risk which may be inherent in 
their presence in drinking water. 

In planning new or expanded water 
supply systems in the next few months, 
owners should be aware that the Na¬ 
tional Academy of Sciences, and Na¬ 
tional Academy of Engineering in 
“Water Quality Criteria,” 1972, have rec¬ 
ommended that the following concentra- 
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tions not be exceeded in sources of water 
to be used for drinking water: 
Aldrln.. O.OOl mg/1 
DDT... 0.05 mg/1 
Dleldrln_ O.OOl mg/1 

It is unlikely that EPA will issue in¬ 
terim primary drinking water standards 
which permit concentrations in finished 
water in excess of these values. 

Organophosphate insecticides have 
be^ considered for inclusion in these 
standards. However, there are not sufB- 
cient data related to their occurraice 
in drinking water or raw water sources 
to warrant setting standards at this time. 
Although these substances are widely 
used in agriculture, they are not usually 
intentionally added to watercourses,' Uie 
possible pathways to water supplies are 
indirect, such as through percolation, 
runoff from treated lands, and accidental 
spills. Many organofrfiosphate insecti¬ 
cides are almost completely degraded 
within days in water partially explaining 
the fact that the intact organ(H>hos- 
phates are seldom detected in water. 

It must be emphasized, however, that 
most organophosphate insecticides are 
Class I poisons. Therefore, authorities 
should be cautioned that accidental 
spills or misuse of these substances might 
demand immediate attention similar to 
that required with any type of acute act¬ 
ing ctmtaminant that enters our nation’s 
water. The use of section 1431 of the Act, 
or State law modeled upon it, may also 
be appropriate in such situati<His. A 
guidance manual ^titled “Policies and 
Procedures for Review and Elvaluatlon of 
Toxicity in Drinking Water of Chemicals 
other than Coagulant Aids’* is avaUaUe 
for use in these situations from the Wa¬ 
ter Supply Research Laboratory, Na¬ 
tional Environmental Research Center, 
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency, 
4676 Ccdumbia Parkway, Cincinnati, 
Ohio 45268. 

The interim primary drinking water 
standards proposed to^y have a limit 
for turbidity (§ 141.14) because turbidity 
in water interferes with disinfection efB- 
cimcy and because high turbidity often 
signals the pres^ce of oUier health haz¬ 
ards. The growth of microorganisms in 
a distribution system is often stimulated 
if excessive particulate or organic mat¬ 
ter is present. The supplier is allowed to 
have no greater than five turbidity units 
in the water (rather than <me) when he 
can show that an effective disinfectant 
£tgent is present in the system in suffi¬ 
cient concentrations to protect the wa¬ 
ter users. 

Ihe standards for microbiological con¬ 
taminants are contained in $ 141.15. The 
maximum levels are in terms of the sur¬ 
rogate coUform bacteria, although the 
purpose of the standard is to protect 
against disease-causing bacteria, viruses, 
protozoa, worms and fungi. The analyti¬ 
cal procedures for direct detection of 
these microorganisms are not well 
enough developed nor practicable for 
widespread application at this timb. To¬ 
tal coliform counts have been used for 
nearly 100 years as indicators because 
the organisms are present in large quan¬ 

tity in the intestinal tracts of humans 
and other warm blooded animals, thus 
the niunber remaining in a water supply 
provides a good correlation with muiI- 
tary significance. 

'TO ease the economic burden on the 
smaller systems, these standards provide 
in 9 141.16 that chlorine residual concen¬ 
trations may be measured and substi¬ 
tuted for a pmtion of the bacteriological 
samples. *17118 alternative is based on the 
assumption that chlorine in proper con¬ 
centrations will destroy those organisms 
which are indirectly being measured by 
the coliform test. Small systems (serving 
4900 or fewer people) may make a total 
substitution, but it should be noted that 
several chlorine samples are required for 
each substituted microbiological sample, 
and a higher chlorine residual must be 
maintained in the system. 

Interim Primary Drinking Water 
Standards for radiological substances are 
not included in the regulations proposed 
today. The Agency intends to publish 
proposed radiological maximiun contam¬ 
inant levels and analytical and sampling 
requirements in the near future. 

Almost all of the maximum contami¬ 
nant levels are based on an assumed con¬ 
sumption of two liters of water per day. 
’The question arises, however, as to 
whether or not it is reasonable to de¬ 
rive the drinking water standards on 
the basis of. the average amount of 
water consumed by any large segment of 
the population (in the case of these 
standards, young adult American males) 
since a large portion of the members of 
that class consume more. 

EPA solicits information as to whether 
or not the present approach is reasonable, 
and whether there is any available infor¬ 
mation regarding the distribution of wa¬ 
ter consumption levels by significant seg¬ 
ments of the American public. 

Sampling and analytical requirements. 
Sections 141.21-141.24 set out the sam¬ 
pling and analytical requirements to be 
followed in determining whether there is 
compliance with the maximum contam¬ 
inant levels. Section 141.21 establishes 
the monitoring frequency for the micro¬ 
biological contaminants. When there is 
an apparent violaticm noted, the supplier 
is directed to accelerate the sampling 
frcxn the same monitoring point imtil 
the results Indicate that the maximum 
contaminant level is no longer exceeded. 
ITie requirement to step up the monitor¬ 
ing is not in lieu of the reporting and no¬ 
tification responsibilities which arise 
when there is a violation. Also, the “check 
samples’’ required by 9 141.21(c) (l)-(c) 
(3) are not to be included in the calcu¬ 
lations of the total samples taken each 
month for the purposes of determining 
compliance with 9 141.21(b). 

A violation of 9141.16 is deemed to oc¬ 
cur when a second properly conducted 
test, which must be run within one hour 
of the first test, shows that the chlorine 
concentration is below the specified level. 
The required sample for coliform analy¬ 
sis must be taken at the point where the 
violation in the chlorine residual was 
detected. 

The sampling frequency for turbidity 
determination (9 141.22) differs for sup¬ 
plies drawing water from underground 
sources and for surface water supplies. It 
is presumed that the likelihood of high 
turbidity in water from underground 
sources is relatively small. 

Section 141.23 sets forth the require¬ 
ments for inorganic chemical sampling 
and analyses. Within one year from the 
effective date of this subpart the supplier 
must make one analysis for inorganic 
chemicals; subsequent analyses must be 
performed yearly if the system does not 
primarily serve transients. Less frequent 
analyses are required for suppliers draw¬ 
ing water from underground sources. If 
this level of an inorganic chemical is 
greater than 75 percent of the maximum 
contaminant level, the supplier is 
directed to re-analyze monthly. 

The sampling frequencies for the in¬ 
organic chemicals, organic chemicals and 
pesticides allows considerable time with¬ 
in which the supplier may take the first 
sample, due to the limited number of 
laboratories capable of making the often 
difficult analyses. Public water suppliers 
are encouraged to begin monitoring for 
these substances even before the effective 
date of this subpart. Any analyses made 
in accordance ^th the analytical pro¬ 
cedures set forth in this subpart but be¬ 
fore the effective date can be considered 
when determining compliance with 
§9 141.23 and 141.24. 

To assure confidence in analytical re¬ 
sults, which in many cases the public 
water suppliers will contract for, a sec¬ 
tion has been added to provide for lab¬ 
oratory certification (9 141.27). 

Reporting requirements. A key provi¬ 
sion of these proposed standards is the 
reporting requirement (9 141.31). Within 
40 days following an analysis required by 
subpart A, the results must be reported to 
either the State or the Regional Adminis¬ 
trator, depending on who has primary 
enforcement responsibility. 

Federal Agencies will at all times re¬ 
port to the Regional Administrator, al¬ 
though they must follow State agency 
substantive standards if the State agency 
has assumed primary enforcement re¬ 
sponsibility. 

If a standard is based upon averaging 
of samples, the report must be filed with¬ 
in 40 days of the first sample used in the 
averaging. If there is a violation, whether 
based on averaging or a single analysis 
with one check analysis, the report must 
be received within 36 hours of the find¬ 
ing of violation. The reports of violations 
of the standards include reports of in¬ 
stances where the monitoring require¬ 
ments have not been followed. 

One of the basic assumptions em¬ 
bodied in the Safe Drinking Water Act 
is that if the public is aware that the 
drinking water being provided is below 
Federal Standards, they will request the 
local officials to reme^ the situation. 
Thus 9 141.32 of these Standards is in¬ 
tended to carry out the statutory direc¬ 
tive that the public served by the public 
water system be adequately Informed of 
the quality of the water they are receiv¬ 
ing. The supplier must give notice of 
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failure to meet the requirements of 
9 141.32 by publicatioo in a newspaper 
or newspapers, by promptly givipg a copy 
of the notice* to the I'V and radio sta¬ 
tions serving the area, and by inclusion 
of the notice in the water bills. FSdlure 
to follow the required monitoring re¬ 
quirements is deaned a violation equal 
to failure to meet a maximum contam¬ 
inant level. 

Public water suppliers are allowed as 
part of the notice to the public to give 
fair explanation of the public health 
significance of any violation, or of any 
variance or exemption, which the sup¬ 
plier must report as required by subsec¬ 
tion (b) of § 141.31. 

The Agency anticipates that additions 
may be made to the public notification 
provision to differentiate between the 
type of notice required in the case of 
emergencies and that provided for in 
9 141.31. 

Siting requirements. The siting re¬ 
quirements of 9141.41 are designed to 
assure that, to the extent practicable, 
the location of the Intake and other ele¬ 
ments of new or expanded water supply 
systems will be such that the public 
water systems will be able to provide a 
continuous supply of healthful drmklng 
water. To the extent practicable, facili¬ 
ties should be located in areas not sub¬ 
ject to floods, earthquakes, fires, or other 
disasters. Section 141.41 is not intended 
to give EPA veto authority over new pub¬ 
lic water systems, although State agen¬ 
cies may have this power. In all cases 
there must be notification of the State 
or Regional Administrator that con¬ 
struction of a new or expanded system 
is contemplated. 

Economic, energy, and chemical con¬ 
siderations. Economic, energy, and 
chemical factors have been considered 
in the development of the Proposed In¬ 
terim National Primary Drinking Water 
Standards. In establishing the phased 
monitoring schedule, the maximum con¬ 
taminant levels themselves, and the no¬ 
tification requirements, every effort has 
been made to identify costs and to keep 
them within the bounds contemplated by 
Congress. 

The estimates contained herein are 
based on data currently available and 
should be considered preliminary. The 
data include the 1969 Community Water 
Supply Study published by the U.S. Pub¬ 
lic Health Service in July 1970. In addi¬ 
tion, EPA has also conducted several 
pilot studies of water supplies of several 
Federal agencies, i.e., U.S. Forest Serv¬ 
ice, Corps of Engineers, Bureau of Rec¬ 
lamation, National Park Service, and 
Interstate Highways to evaluate the 
status and condition of supplies serving 
the travelling public. Until EPA’s in¬ 
ventory of commimity water supplies is 
completed and adequate data are ob¬ 
tained on the capability of each system, 
the full impact of these proposed interim 
regulations will not be known. EPA is 
undertaking a more comprehensive anal¬ 
ysis of the overall impact of the pro¬ 
posed standards and does expect to have 
more definitive estimates to present when 

it promulgates the interim standards. 
EPA expects and invites comments on 
the economic impact of these regulations 
in order that the final regulatkms pia- 
sented are both reasonable aiKl practical. 

The preliminary cost estimates dO not 
appear excessive or inflationary. The 
estimated replacemmt value of the 40,- 
000 community (resident) water systems 
is $125 billion; annual monitoring costs 
for the community water systems would 
be less than 0.02 percent of this value and 
capital costs to bring tlie systems up to 
compliance levels would be about 1 per¬ 
cent of this value. 

Estimated costs are based cm the needs 
of 40,000 systems serving resident popu¬ 
lations and 200,000 supplies serving non¬ 
resident populations. These costs, how¬ 
ever, relate only to the construction and 
operation of facilities to enable water 
supply systems to meet the health re¬ 
late constituent limits that are estab¬ 
lished in these Interim Primary Regula¬ 
tions. This excludes any costs to provide 
for growth of population served and to 
provide for the removal of taste and/or 
odor problems or any other aesthetic de¬ 
sires. The monitoring costs for all com¬ 
munity supplies are estimated to be $20 
million the first year and to increase to 
$30 million after 5 years. Costs during 
intervening and subsequent years will 
vary slightly due to phasing and annual 
frequency of monitoring requirements. 
Capital costs for upgrading these sys¬ 
tems are estimated to be about $1,400 
million, which will result in an annual 
cost of $365 million. 

For the supplies serving non-resident 
populations, monitoring costs will vary 
from $45 million the first 3^ar to $60 
million the fifth year. The capital cost 
for upgrading these systems will be ap¬ 
proximately $6 million. It should be 
noted that the other (non-resident) capi¬ 
tal costs relate only to those pertaining 
to meeting only the proposed bacterio¬ 
logical limits. Most of the chemical limits 
in the proposed regulations were set with 
a view to chronic effects resulting from 
lifetime exposures. Since these systems 
serve a transient population, the need to 
attain the propos^ chemical limits may 
be questionable. The economic conse¬ 
quences could impose severe hardship on 
these small systems and the granting 
of variances and exemptions by the 
States may be justified. No effort was 
made to calcvilate the annual cost re¬ 
lated to these systems, since operating 
and maintenance costs are not known at 
this time. 

The implementation costs are sum- 
merized in the following table: 

[Dollars in millions] 

Annual monitorinK Community Other (Non- Total 
(resident) residential) 

Costs: 
Ist year. $20 $4S $6fi 
Sth year. 30 60 00 

UpKradinK costs: 
Capital costs. 1,400 6 . 
Annual costs. <368 . 

■ Includes operation and maintenance. 

Health costs have not been induded' 
in these estimates, although improved 
water quality will undoubted|li> have « 
beneficial effect on health cosie. Stofdies 
are underway to deteraiine costs, 
and they will be integrated as seon'as 
possible. 

It should be noted that the total an¬ 
nual monitoring costs do give credit to 
the bacteriological monitoring that Is 
being performed today. For example, 700 
of the estimated 40,000 community water 
systems are currently subject to Federal 
purview, under the interstate quarantine 
regulations of the Public Health Service 
Act. These systems, which include many 
of the major cities in the country, serve 
a resident population of 85 million, or 
more than half of the population served 
by community systems. For these systems 
bacteriological monitoring is now ade¬ 
quate and in fact some chemical mon¬ 
itoring is also being performed. 

A potential major cost-reducing factor 
not included in these figures is expanded 
control by EPA over efBuents of the listed 
contaminants. EPA is currently exam¬ 
ining the implications of controlling pol¬ 
lutants at the source of discharge into 
the water. In effect, by controlling the 
pollutants at their source. EPA vdll be 
reducing the direct economic biu*den on 
the public sector. 

The energy requirements to operate 
the added facilities and to produce the 
chemicals for clarification (alum. lime, 
etc.) constituent removal (sulfuric acid, 
activated carbon, etc.) and disinfection 
are estimated at 21 billion BTU’s annu¬ 
ally or .025 percent of the current esti¬ 
mate for the 1975 national energy 
consumption of 80 quadrillion BTU’s. 

The chemical requirements related to 
the additional treatment required by the 
proposed standards are summarized 
below: 

Chemieal rtquirementt 

Percent of 
Chemical Pounds (10) annual 

production 

Filter grade alum. 870 16 (1978) 
Activated carbon.. 7 4 (1972) 
lime. 421 1 (1972) 

167 0.8 (1978) 
as (1978) Su^huric add.,_ 

Sodium hydroxide.'._ 
478 

77 a 4 (1978) 

Alum and activated carbon will appar¬ 
ently require significant portions of 
current total production. These chem¬ 
icals are used in large part for water 
treatment and the raw materials are 
abundant. Therefore it is not believed 
that significant problems will be involved 
in increasing their production in the long 
term. 

Impact on State Programs. With par¬ 
ticular regard to the potential impact of 
the proposed regulations on State pro¬ 
grams, EPA is anxious to have compre¬ 
hensive comments and data on costs and 
administrative burden generally, as well 
as on feasibility of State program imple¬ 
mentation in light of dates scheduled for 
the effectiveness of the regulations. 
Specifically, EPA requests data to show 

FEDEIAL REGISTER, VOl. 40, NO. 51—FRIDAY, MARCH 14, 1975 



11994 raOPOSEO RULES 

the costs to the States that will follow 
from the testing requirements imposed 
by these regulations on p«g^c water sys¬ 
tems. from the requirement that public 
water systems report test results to the 
States, and from the requirement that 
tests must be conducted by laboratories 
approved by the States. will con¬ 
sider such cost information as is sup¬ 
plied prior to promulgathig final Interim 
Primary Drinking Water Standards as 
well as considering such data and infor¬ 
mation in the develomnent of proposed 
State Program regulations, section 1421, 
which is scheduled for issuance in idld 
June 1975. 

CommenU and public hearings. EPA 
presented draft Interim Primary Drink¬ 
ing Water Standards to the National 
Eirinking Water Advisory Cotmcil estab¬ 
lished pursuant to section 1446 of the Act. 
At a meeting held February 26 and 27, 
1975, the Council made recommendations 
with respect to these standards and to 
the extent deemed appropriate, changes 
have been made in view of these recom¬ 
mendations. 

Interested persons may participate in 
this rulemaking process by. sub^tting 
written comments in triplicate to the 
Water Supply Divisicm (WH-450). En¬ 
vironmental Protection Agency, Wash¬ 
ington. D.C. 20460, Attenticm: Comment 
Clerk, Interim Primary Drinking Water 
Standards. 

Comments on all aspects of tDe pro¬ 
posed regulations are solicited. AH com¬ 
ments received on or before May 16.1975, 
will be considered. If the comments are 
criticisms of the adequacy of data rdied 
upon by EPA. the comments should 
identify and. if possible, provide addl- 
tkmal data from published literature and 
the individual should indicate why and 
how this information should be used. 

Copies of the Statement of Basis and 
Purpose for these Proposed Interim Pri¬ 
mary Standards and other relevant doc¬ 
uments will be avaihmie after March 16. 
1975, from the EPA Freedom of Informa¬ 
tion Center, Room 206, West Tower, 
Waterside Mall, 401M Street, SW. Wash- 
ingtxm, D.C. 20460, Attention: Rubye 
Mullins. A copy of all puUic comments 
and transcripts of the pid>lic hearings 
will be available for inspection and copy¬ 
ing from the EPA Freedom of Informa¬ 
tion Center. For public review and copy- 
ing, the EPA Information Regulation (40 
CRl Part 2) provides that a reasonable 
fee may be charged fm* the copying 
s«Tice. 

In addition to considering public com¬ 
ments sent to EPA, the Agency will hold 
public hearings at the following loca¬ 
tions, to receive comments and state- 
mente. Persons who wish to make 
statements at these sessions are urged 
to sid>mit written ct^ies of their ronarks 
in triplicate at the time they are pre¬ 
sented tor inclusion in the record. Per¬ 
sons wishing to attend are also urged to 
confirm by telephone the exact location 
of the hearing. 

AprUlS, 1975 

0:30 ajn. 

AprU 17. 1975 

9:30 a.m. 

AprU 33.1975 

0:30 am'. 

A(Hll 36. 1975 

9:30 am. 

SPA ReglOD X 

John P. Kennedy Federal 

BuUdlng 
Boston, Mass. 03303 

Telephone: (617) 333-6486 

SPABeghxiV 

330 8. Dearborn St. 

Chicago, Illinois 

TelepllbDe: (313) 563-7736 

EPA Region IX 

100 Caltfomla St. 
San Praniysoo. Caltfomla 

04111 
Telephone: (415) 556-2006 

Washington. D.C. 

EPA Headquarters 

Waterside Mall 

401 M Street SW 

Washington. D.C. 3046P 
Telephone: (303 ) 426-8847 

Dated: Idarch 10.1975. 

Russell E. Tbain, 

Administrator. 
StmCHAPTCK D-WATOI PWOORAMS 

FART 141—NATIONAL TMTERIM 
PRIMARY DRINKING WATER STANOA1I06 

Sec. 

141.1 Appucabmty. 

141X DeftnlUons. 
1414 Coverage. 
141.11 Ma»lnt»im contaminant levels Ich- in¬ 

organic 
141.13 a*-irtTniim nowtarntnant leTels for or- 

ganlc chemicals. 
141.13 Majtmiim contaminant levels for 

pesticides. 
141.14 aiMimiinn contaminant levels lor 

turbidity. 

141.15 Maslmnm microbiological oontami- 

A nant levels. 

ftl.l6 Substitution of residual chlorine 

measurement (or total colUorm 

measurement. 

14141 Microbiological contaminant sam¬ 

pling and analytical requirements. 

141.23 Turbidity sampling and analytical 

requirements. 

14143 Inorganic chemical sampling and 

analytical requirements. 

14144 Pesticide and organic chemicals sam¬ 

pling and analytical requirements. 

14147 Laboratory certification. 

141.31 Beportlng reqiUrements. 

14143 Public notification of variances, ex¬ 

emptions and non-compliance with 

standards. 

141.41 Siting requirements. 

141.51 Effective date. 

ArTTBoairr: Secs. 1412, 1414, 1415, 1460 of 

Pub. L. 93-628. 

§ 141.1 Ai^icability. 

This subpart sets forth the interim pri¬ 
mary drinking water standards required 
by section 1412 of the Safe Drhiking 
Water Act (Pub. L. 93-523). 

§ 141.2 Definitions. 

As used in this subpart the term: 
(a) “Act” means the Safe Drinking 

Water Act, Pub. L. 93-523. 
(b) “Community water system” means 

a public water system which serves a 
population of which 70 percent or greater 
are residents. 

(c) “Contaminant” means any phsrsi- 
cal, chemical, biological, or radiological 
substance or matter in water. 

(d) ^‘Maximum contaminant lev^” 
means the maximum permissible level of 
a contaminai^ in water which is deliv¬ 
ered to the free flowing outlet of the 
ultimate user of a public watjtr system. 

(e> “Person” means an individual, cor¬ 
poration, company, association, partner¬ 
ship, State, municipality, or Federal 
agency. 

(f) “PubUc water system” means a sys¬ 
tem for the provision to the public of 
piped water for human consumption, if 
such system has at least fifteen service 
coonections or regularly serves «m Aver¬ 
age of at least twenW~five individuals 
daily at least three months nut of the 
year. Such term includes (1) any collec¬ 
tion, treatment, storage, and distribution 
feu:ilitles under control of the operator 
of such si^tem and used primarily in 
connection with such syst^, and (2) 
any collection or pretreatment storage 
facilities not under such control which 
are used primarUy in connection with 
such system. 

(g) “State” means the agency ot the 
State government which has Jurisdiction 
over public water systems. During any 
period when a State does not have pri¬ 
mary enforcement responsibility, the 
term ‘State’ means the Regkmal Ad¬ 
ministrator, Environmental Protection 
Agency. 

(h) “Supplier of water” means any 
person who owns or operates a public 
water system. 

§ 141.3 Coverage. 

The interim primary drinking water 
standards under this subpart shall apply 
to each public water system in a Stat^ 
except that such standards shall not I4>- 
ply to a pidallc water system which— 

(a) Consists only of distribution and 
storage facilities (and does not have any 
collection and treatment facilities); 

(b) Obtains all of its water from, but 
is not owned or (H)erated by, a public 
water system to which such regulations 
apply; 

(c) Does not sell water to any person; 
and 

(d) Is not a carrier which conveys pas¬ 
sengers in Interstate commerce. 

§ 141.11 Maximnm rantamiiuint levels 
for inorganic chemicals. 

(a) The following are the maximum 
contaminant levels for inorganic chem¬ 
icals: 

Level 
Contaminant: (my/1) 

Arsenlo _ 0.06 

Barium _ 1. 
Cadmium _._ 0.010 

Chrcanliun_ 0.06 

Cyanide_ 0.2 

Lead_ 0.06 
Mercury___ 0.002 

Nitrate (as N)_10. 
Selenium _ 0.01 

Sliver_ 0.06 

(b) When the annual average of the 
maximum daily air temperatures for the 
location in which the public water sys¬ 
tem is situated is the following, the cor- 
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responding concentraticHi of fluoride 
shall not be exceeded: 

Temperature 
diTF') 

(CV Level (mg/l) 

«0.0 to 63.7. . 10.0 to 12.0. 2.4 
63.8 to 68.8. . 12.1 to 14.6. 2.2 
68.4 to 83.8. . 14.7 to 17.6. 2.0 
63.9to7ae. . 17.7 to 21.4_ 1.8 
70.7 to 79.2. . 21.6 to 26.2. 1.6 
79.3 to 90.6. . 26.8 to 82.6. 1.4 

The requirements of this paragraph (b) 
do not apply to public water supplies 
serving only educational institutions. 

§ 141.12 Maximum contaminant levels 

for organic chemicals. 

The maximtun contaminant level for 
the total concentraticm of organic chem¬ 
icals. as determined by the carbon chlo¬ 
roform extract method set forth in 
§ 141.24(b). is 0.7 mg/1. 

§ 141.13 Maximum contaminant levels 

for pesticides. 

The following are the maximum con¬ 
taminant levels for pesticides: 

(a) Chlorinated Hydrocarbons: 
Level mg/l 

(Thlordane (cis and trams) (1,3,4,6,- 
6,7,8,8 - Octachloro - 3a,4,6,7s- 
tetratiydro-4,7-methanolndah) _ 0.003 

Endrln (1,2,3,4,10,10 - Hexachloro- 
6,7 - epoxy - l,4,4a,5,6,7,8,8a- 
octahydro-1,4-endo, endo-6,8- 
dlmethano naphthalene)_ 0.0002 

Heptachlor (1,4,6,6,7,8,8-H e p t a- 
chloro-3a,4,7.7a-tetrahydro 4,7- 
methanolndene)_ 0.0001 

Heptochlor Epoxide (1,4,5,6,7,8,8- 
Heptachloro - 2,3-epoxy-3a.4,7,7a- 
tetrahydro-4,7-inethanolndan) . 0.0001 

Lindane (1,2,3,4,6,6-Hexachloro- 
cyclohexane, gamma isomer)_0.004 

Methoxychlor (l,l.l-Trichloro-2,3- 
biaJp-methoxyphenyl] ethane). 0.1 

Toxaphene (0,oH,oClg—^Technical 
chlorinated camphene, 67-69% 
chlorine) -0.005 

(b) Chlorophenoxys: 
2,4-D (2,4-Dlchlorophenoxyaoetic 

add) _0.1 
3,4,5-TP Silvex (2,4,5-Trlchloro- 

phenoxypropionlc acid)_0.01 

§ 141.14 Maximum contaminant level 

of turbidity. 

The maximum contaminant level of 
turbidity in the drinking water at a rep¬ 
resentative entry point(s) to the distri¬ 
bution system is one turbidity unit (TU). 
as determined pursuant to § 141.22. ex¬ 
cept that five or fewer turbidity units 
may be allowed if the supplier of water 
can demonstrate to the State that the 
higher turbidity does not: 

(a) Interfere with disinfection; 
(b) Prevent maintenance of an effec¬ 

tive disinfectant agent throughout the 
distribution system; and 

(c) Interfere with microbiological 
determinations. 

§ 141.15 Maximum microbiological <»n- 

taminant levels. 

(a) The supplier of water may em¬ 
ploy one of two methods to determine 
cconpliance with the collform maximum 
contaminant levels. 

(1) When the supplier of water em¬ 
ploys the membrane filter technique 
pursuant to 9141.21(a) the collform 
densities shall not exceed one per 100 
milliliters as the arithmetic mean of all 
samples examined per month; and either 

(1) Four per 100 milliliters in more 
than one standard sample when less 
than 20 are examined per month; or 

(li) Four per 100 milliliters in more 
than five percent of the standard sam¬ 
ples when 20 or more are examined per 
month. 

(2) (i) When the supplier of water em¬ 
ploys the fermentation tube method and 
10 milliliter standard portions pursuant 
to 9 141.21, collforms shall not be pres¬ 
ent in more than 10 percent of the por¬ 
tions in any month; and either 

(A) Three or more portions in one 
sample when less than 20 samples are 
examined per month; or 

(B) Three or more portions in more 
than five percent of the samples if 20 or 
more samples are examined per month. 

(ii) When the supplier of water em¬ 
ploys the fermentation tube method and 
100 milliliter standard portions pursu¬ 
ant to 9 141.21(a) collforms shall not be 
present in more than 60 percent of the 
portions in any month; and either 

(A) Five or more portions in more 
than one sample when less than five 
samples are examined; or 

(B) Five or more porticms in more 
than 20 percent of the samples when 
five samples or more are examined. 

(b) The supplier of water shall pro¬ 
vide water in which there shall be no 
greater than 500 organisms per one mil¬ 
liliter as determined by the standard 
bacterial plate count provided in 
9 141.21(f). 

§ 141.16 SubflUtution of residual chlo¬ 

rine measurement for total coliform 

measurement. 

(a) The supplier of water may, with 
the approval of the State, substitute the 
use of chlorine residtial monitoring for 
not more than 75 percent of the samples 
required to be taken by 9 141.21(b), pro¬ 
vided that the supplier of water takes 
chlorine residual samples at points which 
are representative of the conditions 
within the distribution system at the 
frequency of at least four for each sub¬ 
stituted microbiological sample. There 
shall be at least daily determinations of 
chlorine residual. Measurements shall be 
made in accordance with “Standard 
Methods,” 13th Ed., pp 129-132. When 
the supplier of water exercises the op¬ 
tion provided in this paragraph (a), he 
shall maintain no less than 0.2 mg/l free 
chlorine in the public water distribution 
system. 

(b) For public water systems serving 
4900 or fewer persons, the supplier may, 
with the approval of the State, make a 
total substitution of chlorine residual 
measurement for the samples required to 
be taken by 9 141.21(6): Provided, That 
the supplier of water takes chlorine re¬ 
sidual samples at points which are repre- 
^ntative of the conditions within the 
distribution system at the rate of one 
per day for each microbiological sample 
required to be taken per month imder 

9141.21. When the supplier of water ex¬ 
ercises the option provided by this para¬ 
graph (b> he shall maintain no 1^ than 
0.3 mg/l free chlorine in the public water 
distribution system. Measurements shall 
be made in accordance with “Standard 
Methods,” 13th Ed., pp 129-132. 

§ 141.21 Microbiological contaminant 

sampling and analytical require¬ 

ments. 

(a) The supplier of water shall make 
coliform density measurements, for the 
purpose of determining compliance with 
9141.15, in accordance with the anahrti- 
cal recommendations set forth in 
“Standard Methods for the Examination 
of Water and Wastewater,” American 
Public Health Association, 13th Edition, 
pp 662-688, except that only a 100 milli¬ 
liter sample size shall be employed in 
the membrane filter technique. The 
samples shall be taken at points which 
are representative of the conditions 
within the distribution system. 

(b) The supplier of water shall take 
coliform density samples at regular in¬ 
tervals throughout the month, and in 
number proportionate to the population 
served by the public water system. In no 
event shall the frequency be less than as 
set forth below: 

Minimum number of 
Population served: samples per month 

25 to 2,600___ 2 
2.601 to 3,300_   3 
3.301 to 4,100.  4 
4.101 to 4,900.  5 
4.901 to 6,800_.   6 
6301 to 6,700.   7 
6.701 to 7,600.  8 
7.601 to 8,600_ 9 
8.601 to 9,400.  10 
9,401 to 10,300_ 11 
10.301 to 11,100. 12 
11.101 to 12,000.    13 
12,001 to 12300_ 14 
12.901 to 13,700.  16 
13.701 to 14,600.   16 
14.601 to 15,600.L.. 17 
16.601 to 16,300.  18 
16.301 to 17,200.   19 
17301 to 18,100_ 20 
18.101 to 18,900.    21 
18.901 to 19300...  22 
19,801 to 20,700_   23 
20.701 to 21,600.  24 
21.601 to 22,300.   26 
22301 to 23300.    26 
23301 to 24,000 .   27 
24,001 to 24300 .  28 
24.901 to 25,000 _ 29 
25,001 to 28,000 _    30 
28,001 to 33,000 ..     36 
33,001 to 37,000 . 40 
37,001 to 41,000 .    45 
41,001 to 46,000 _ 60 
46,00r to 50,000 _ 55 
50,001 to 64,000 .  60 
54,001 to 59,000 _  66 
69,001 to 64,000 . 70 
64,001 to 70,000 ..  76 
70,001 to 76,000 _ 80 
76,001 to 83,000 _   85 
83,001 to 90,000 ..   90 
90,001 to 06,000 _ 96 
96,001 to 111,000. 100 

111,001 to 130,000. 110 
130,001 to 160,000.     120 
160,001 to 190,000.  130 
190,001 to 220,000. 140 
220,001 to 260,000....... 160 
260,001 to 290,000. 160 
290,001 to 320,000_170 

FEDERAL REGISTER, VOL. 40, NO. 51—FRIDAY, MARCH 14, 1975 



11996 PROPOSED RULES 

Minimum number of 
Population aerved: aampUa per month 

320.001 to 360,000. 180 
360,001 to 410,000_190 
410,001 to 460,000. 200 
460,001 to 600,000_210 
600,001 to 660,000.-. 220 
560,001 to 600,000.  230 
600,001 to 660,000..—.240 
660,001 to 720,000. 260 
720,001 to 780/X)0. 260 
780.000 to 840,000_270 
840,001 to 910,000_   280 
910,001 to 970,000.L.290 
970,001 to 1,060,000_ 800 

1,060,001 to 1,140,000. 810 
1,140,001 to 1,230.000. 820 
1,230,001 to 1320,000.  380 
1320.001 to 1,420,000. 340 
1,430,001 to 1320,000_   360 
1320.001 to 1,630,000.  360 
1,630,001 to 1,730,000...  370 
1,730,001 to 1,860,000.   880 
1,860,001 to 1,970,000.   390 
1370.001 to 2,060,000. 400 
2,060,001 to 2370.000_410 
2370,001 to 2,610,000. 430 
2,610.001 to 2,750,000. 430 
2,760,001 to 3,020,000.   440 
3,030,001 to 8330,000_    450 
3330,001 to 3,620,000_  460 
3,620,001 to 3,960,000_   470 
3360,001 to 4,310,000_480 
4310,001 to 4,690,000.   490 

^.690,000 ..500 

(c) (1) When the coliform colonies in a 
single standard sample exceed four per 
100 milliliters (S 141.15(a) (1)), daily 
samples shall be collected and examined 
from the same sampling point until the 
results obtained from at least two con¬ 
secutive samples show less than one coli¬ 
form per 100 milliliters. 

(2) When organisms of the coliform 
group occur in three or more 10 ml por¬ 
tions of a single standard sample 
(S 141.15(a) (2) (i)). daily samples shaji 
be collected and examined from the same 
sampling point until the results obtained 
from at least two consecutive samples 
show no positive tubes. 

(3) Whai organisms cf the coliform 
group occur in ail five of tiie 100 ml por¬ 
tions of a single stacxlard sample 
(S 141.15(a) (2) (ii)), daily samples shsdl 
be collected and examined from the same 
sampling point imtil the results obtained 
frcun at least two consecutive samples 
show no positive tubes. 

(4) The location at which the check 
sample was taken pursuant to para¬ 
graphs (c) (1), (2) or (3) of this section 
must not be eliminated from future sam¬ 
pling because of a history of questionable 
water quality. CTheck samples shall not be 
included in calculating the total numb^ 
of samples taken each month to deter¬ 
mine compliance with S 141.15. 

(d) When a particular sampling point 
has been confinned, by the first check 
sample examined as directed in para- 
gn^^ (c) (1). (2), or (3) of this sec¬ 
tion, to be in non-comidiance with the 
maximum ocmtamlnant levels set fraih 
in 1141.15, the supplier of water 
notify the State as prescribed in 9 141.31. 

(e) When the maximum contaminant 
levels set fcxth in paragraphs (a) (1) or 
(2) of f 141.15 are exceeded as confirmed 
by check sami^ taken pursuant to par¬ 
agraphs (c) (1) , (2), or (3) oi this sec¬ 

tion. the supplier of water shall repmt 
as directed in f 141.32(a). 

(f) When a particular sampling point 
has been shown to be in non-compliance 
with the requirements of 1141.16. water 
from that location shall be retested 
within one hour. If the ncm-oomplisuice 
is confirmed, the State shall be notified 
as prescribed in i 14121. Also, if the 
non-compliance is confinned, a sample 
for coliform analysis must be immedi- 
idcly collected from that sampling pc^t 
and the results of such analysis repmted 
to the State. 

(g) Standard bacteria plate coimt 
samples shall be analyzed in accordance 
with the recommmdation set forth in 
“Stcmdard Methods for the Examination 
of Water and Wastewater.” American 
PuUic Health Association, 13th Edition, 
pp 660-662. Samples taken for the pur¬ 
pose of {date count analysis shall be col¬ 
lected at points which are r^resentative 
of conditions within the distribidion sys¬ 
tem at a frequency at least equal to 10 
percent ai the frequency for c(difmm an¬ 
alysis as directed in paragraph (b) of 
this section with the exception that at 
least one sample shall be collected and 
analyzed mmithly. 

§ 141.22 Turbidity sampling and ana¬ 

lytical reqfuirements. 

(a) Samples shall be taken at a repre¬ 
sentative mitry point(s) to the water 
distributimi sjrstem at least once per 
day (at least once per month for sup¬ 
plies using water obtained from under¬ 
ground sources) for the purpose of mak¬ 
ing turbidity measurements to determine 
compliance with 9 141.14. The measure¬ 
ment shall be made in accordance 
with the recommendations set forth in 
“Standard Methods for the Examination 
of Water and Wastewater,” American 
Public Health Association, 13 th Edition, 
pp. 350-353 (Nephelometric Method). 

(b) In the event that such measure¬ 
ment indicates that the maximum allow¬ 
able limit has been exceeded, the sam¬ 
pling and measuremmt shall be repeated 
within one hour. The results of the two 
measurements shall be averaged, and if 
the average confirms that the maximum 
allowable limit has been exceeded, this 
average shall be reported as directed in 
9 141.31. If the monthly average of all 
samples exceeds the maximum allowable 
limit, this fact shall be reported as di¬ 
rected in 9 141.32(a). 

(c) The requirements of this 9 141.22 
Rhaii not apply to public water systems 
other than community water systems 
which use water obtained from under¬ 
ground sources. 

§ 141.23 Inorganic chemical Mmpling 

and analytical requiranents. 

(a)(1) To establish an initial record 
of water quality, an analysis of sub¬ 
stances for the purpose of determining 
c(Nnpliance with 9 141.111 shall be com¬ 
pleted for all community water systems 
utilizing surface water sources within 
one year following the effective date of 
this subpart. This analysis shall be re¬ 
peated at yearly intervals. 

(2) An analysis for communtiy water 
systems utilizing ground water sources 

shall be completed within two years fol¬ 
lowing the effective date of this subpart. 
This analysis shall be repeated at three- 
year intervals. 

(3) Analyses for public water systems 
other than community water systems, 
whether supplied by surface or ground 
water sources, shall be completed within 
six years following the effective date of 
this subpart. These analyses shall be re¬ 
peated at five-year intervals. 

(b) If the supplier of water determines 
or has been informed by the State that 
the level of any contaminant is 75 per¬ 
cent or more of the maximum contam¬ 
inant level, he shall analyze for the 
presrace and quantity of that contami¬ 
nant at least once per month following 
the initial analysis or information. If, 
after conducting monthly testing for a 
period of at least one year, the supplier 
of water demonstrates to the satisfaction 
of the State that the level of such con¬ 
taminant is stable and due to a natiual 
condition of the water source, he may re¬ 
duce the frequency of analysis for that 
contaminant consistent with the require¬ 
ments of paragraph (a) of this section. 

(c) If the supplier of water determines 
or has been informed by the State that 
the level of any contaminant listed in 
9 141.11 exceeds the maximum contam¬ 
inant level for the substance, he Rhaii 
confirm such determination or informa¬ 
tion by repeating the analysis within 24 
hours following the initial analysis or in¬ 
formation, and then at least at week^ 
intervals during the period of time the 
maximum contaminant level for that 
substance has been exceeded, or until a 
monitoring schedule as a condition to a 
variance, exemption or enforcement ac¬ 
tion shall become effective. The results of 
s\ich repetitive testing shall be averaged 
and reported as prescribed in paragraph 
(d) of this section. 

(d) To Judge the compliance of a pub¬ 
lic water system with the maximum con¬ 
taminant levels listed in 9 141.11, aver¬ 
ages of data shall be used and shall be 
rounded to the same number of signifi¬ 
cant figures as the maximum contam¬ 
inant level for the substance in question. 
Each average shall be calculated on a 
past 12-m(mth moving average basis if 
less than twelve samples per year are 
analyzed, and on a past three month 
moving average basis if twelve or more 
samples per year are analyzed. In cases 
where the maximum contaminant level 
has been exceeded in any one samite, the 
average concentration shall be calcu¬ 
lated on a (me-month moving average 
basis and reported pursuant to f 141.31. 
If the mean of the samples comprising 
the <me month moving average exceeds 
the maximum contaminant level, 4he 
supplier of water shall give public notice 
pursuant to 9 141.32(a). 

(e) The provisions of paragraphs (c) 
and-(d) of this section notwithstanding, 
compliance with the maximum contami¬ 
nant level for nitrate shall be deter¬ 
mined on the basis of individual analyses 
rather than by averages. When a level 
exceeding the maxlmiun contaminant 
level for nitrate is found, the analyses 
shall be repeated within 24 hours, and if 
the mean of the two analyses exceeds the 
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maximum ccmtaminant level, the sup¬ 
plier of water shall report his findings 
pursuant to 9S 141.31 and 141.32(a). 

(f) Analyses conducted to determine 
compliance with 9141.11 shall be made 
in accordance with the following meth¬ 
ods: 

(1) Arsenic—Atomic Absorption Meth¬ 
od, “Methods for Chemical-Analysis of 
Water and Wastes,” pp. 95-96, Environ¬ 
mental Protection Agency, Office of 
Technology Transfer, Washington, D.C. 
20460,1974. 

(2) Barium—Atomic Absorption Meth¬ 
od, “Standard Methods for the Exam¬ 
ination of Water and Wastewater,” 131Ji 
Edition, pp. 210-215, or “Methods for 
Chemical Analysis of Water and Wastes,” 
pp. 97-98, Environmental Protection 
Agency, Office of Technology Transfer, 
Washington, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(3) Cadmltun—Atomic Absorption 
Method, “Standard Methods for the Ex¬ 
amination of Water and Wsistewater,” 
13th Edition, pp. 210-215, or “Methods 
for Chemical Analysis of Water and 
Wastes,” pp. 101-103, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Office of Technology 
Transfer, Washin^n, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(4) Chromium—Atomic Absorption 
Method, “Standard Methods for the Ex¬ 
amination of water and Wastewater,” 
13th Edition, pp. 210-215, or “Methods 
for Chemical Analysis of Water and 
Wastes,” pp. 105-106, Environmental 
Protection Agency, Office of Technology 
Transfer, Washington, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(5) Cyanide—Titration or Colorimet¬ 
ric Methods, “Methods for Chemical 
Analysis of Water and Wastes,” pp. 40- 
48, Environmental Protection Agency, 
Office of Technology Transfer, Wash¬ 
ington. D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(6) Lead—^Atomic Absorption Method, 
“Standards Methods for the Examina¬ 
tion of Water and Wastewater,” 13th 
Edition, pp. 210-215, or “Methods for 
Chemical Analysis of Water and 
Wastes,” pp. 112-113, Environmental 
Protection Agency. Office of Technology 
Transfer, Washington, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(7) Mercury—Plameless Atomic Ab¬ 
sorption Method. “Methods for Chemical 
Analysis of Water and Wastes,” pp. 118- 
126, Environmental Protection Agency, 
Office of Technology Transfer, Washing¬ 
ton, D.C. 20460,1974. 

(8) Nitrate—Brucine Colorimetric 
Method, “Standard Methods for the Ex¬ 
amination of Water and Wastewater,” 
13th Edition, pp. 461-464, or Cadmium 
Reduction Method. “Methods for Chemi¬ 
cal Analysis of Water and Wastes,” pp. 
201-206, Environmental Protection 
Agency, Office of Technology Transfer. 
Washington. D.C. 20460,1974. 

(9) Selenium—^Atomic Absorption 
Method. “Methods for Chemical Analysis 
of Water and Wastes,” p. 145, Environ¬ 
mental Protection Agency, Office of 
Technology Transfer, Washington, D.C. 
20460,1974. 

(10) Silver—Atomic Absorption Meth¬ 
od, “Standard Methods for the Examina¬ 
tion of Water and Wastewater,” 13th 
Eklition. pp. 210-215, or “Methods for 
Chemical Analysis of Water and 
Wastes,” p. 146, Environmental Protec¬ 

tion Agency. Office of Technology Trans¬ 
fer, Washington, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

(11) Fluoride—Electrode Method. 
“Standard Methods for the Examination 
of Water and Wastewater,” 13th Edition, 
pp. 172-174, or “Methods for Chemical 
Analysis of Water and Wastes,” pp. 65- 
67, Environmental Protection Agency, 
Office of Technology Transfer, Washing¬ 
ton, D.C. 20460, 1974, or Colorimetric 
Method with Preliminary Distillation, 
“Standard Methods for the Examination 
of Water and Wastewater,” 13th Edition, 
pp. 171-172 and 174-176, or “Methods for 
Chemical Analysis of Water and 
Wastes,” pp. 59-60, Enviroiunental Pro¬ 
tection Agency, Office of Technology 
Transfer, Washington, D.C. 20460, 1974. 

§ 141.24 Pesticide and organic diem- 
icals sampling and analytical require¬ 
ments. 

(a) (1) To establish an initial record of 
water quality, an analysis of substances 
for the purpose of determining compli¬ 
ance with 99 141.12 and 141.13 shall be 
completed for all community water sys¬ 
tems utilizing stirface water sources 
within one year following the effective 
date of this subpart. This analysis shall 
be repeated at yearly Intervals. 

(2) An analysis for community water 
systems utilizing ground water sources 
shall be completed within two years fol¬ 
lowing the effective date of this subpart. 
This analysis shall be r^ieated at three- 
year intervals. 

(3) Analyses for public water systems 
other than community water systems, 
whether supplied by surface or ground 
water sources, shall be completed with¬ 
in six years following the effective date 
of this subpart. These analyses shall be 
repeated at five-year intervals. 

(b) If the supplier of water determines 
or has been Informed by the State that 
the level of any contaminant is 75 per¬ 
cent or more of the maximum contami¬ 
nant level, he shall analyze for the pres¬ 
ence and quantity of that contaminant 
at least once per month following the 
initial analysis or information. If. after 
conducting monthly testing for a peri¬ 
od of at least one year, the supplier of 
water demonstrates to the satisfaction 
of the State that the level of such con¬ 
taminant is stable and due to a natural 
condition of the water source, he may re¬ 
duce the frequency of analysis for that 
contaminant consistent with the re¬ 
quirements of paragraph (a) of this sec¬ 
tion. 

. (c) If the supplier of water determines 
or has been informed by the State that 
the level of contaminants set forth in 
9 141.12 exceeds the maximum contami¬ 
nant level, he shall confirm such deter¬ 
mination or information by repeating 
the analyses within two weeks following 
the initial analysis or information. The 
average of the two analyses, if in excess 
of the. maximiun contaminant level, 
shall be reported as directed in 99141.31 
and 141.32(a). 

(d) If the supplier of water determines 
or has been informed by the State that 
the level of any contaminant listed in 
9 141.13 exceeds the maximum contami¬ 

nant level for the substance, he shall 
confirm such determination or informa¬ 
tion by repeating the analysis within 24 
hours following the initial analysis or in¬ 
formation. and then at least at we^ly 
intervals diuring the period of time the 
maximum contaminant level for that 
substance has been exceeded, or until a 
monitoring schedule as a condition to 
variance, exemption or enforcement ac¬ 
tion shall become effective, 'flie results 
of such repetitive testing shall be aver¬ 
aged and reported as prescribed in peu'a- 
graph (e) of this section. 

(e) To judge the compliance of a pub¬ 
lic water system with the maximum con¬ 
taminant levels listed in 9 141.13. aver¬ 
ages of data shall be used and shall be 
rounded to the same number of slgidfl- 
cant flgxires as the maximum contami¬ 
nant level for the substance in question. 
Each average shall be calculated on a 
past 12-month moving'average basis if 
less than twelve samples per year are 
analyzed, and on a past three month 
moving average basis if twelve or more 
samples per year are analyzed. In cases 
where the maximum contaminant levels 
of 9 141.13 have been exceeded in any one 
sample, the average concentration shall 
be calculated on a one-month moving 
average basis and reported pursuant to 
9 141.31. If the mean of the samples 
comprising the one month moving aver¬ 
age exceeds the maximum contaminant 
level, the supplier of water shall give 
public notice pursuant to 9 141.32(a). 

(f) Sampling and analyses made to 
determine compliance with 9 141.12 shall 
be made in accordance with “An Im¬ 
proved Method for Determining Organics 
in Water by Activated Carbon Absorp¬ 
tion and Solvent Extraction,” Parts 1 and 
2. Buelow, et al.. Journal of American 
Water Works Association. 65: 57, 197 
(1973). 

(g) Analyses made to determine com¬ 
pliance with 9 141.13(a) shall be made 
in accordance with “Method for Organo- 
chlorine Pesticides in Industrial Efflu¬ 
ents,” MDQARIi, Environmental Protec¬ 
tion Agency, Cincinnati, Ohio. November 
28. 1973. 

(h) Analyses made to determine com¬ 
pliance with 9 141.13(b) shall be con¬ 
ducted in accordance with “Methods for 
Chlorinated Phenoxy Acid Herbicides in 
Industrial Effluenls,” MDQARL, Cincin¬ 
nati, Ohio, November 23, 1973. 

§ 141,27 Laboratory certification. 

For the purposes of determining com¬ 
pliance with 99 141.21 through 141.24, 
samples may be considered only if they 
have been analyzed by a laboratory ap¬ 
proved by the State. The approval shall 
be contingent upon maintenance of 
proper laboratory methods suid technical 
competence and upon the retention for 
inspection at reasonable times of ana¬ 
lytical results. Approved laboratories 
shall make periodic reports as required 
by the State. 

§ 141.31 Reporting requirements. 

The supplier of water shall report with¬ 
in 40 days following a test, measurement 
or analysis required to be made by this 
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subpart, the results of that test, measure¬ 
ment or analysis; Provided, Tliat the sup¬ 
plier of water shall report within 36 hours 
the failing to meet any standards (in¬ 
cluding fsdlure to cmnply with monitor¬ 
ing requirements) set forth in this sub- 
part. Reports required to be made by this 
S 141.31 shall be communicated to the 
State, except that Federal Agencies shall 
report to the Regional Administrator. 

§ 141.32 PoUir notification of var¬ 
iances, exemptions and noncompli¬ 
ance with standards. 

(a) The suiwlier of water shall give 
notice to the persons served by the pub¬ 
lic water syst«n of any failure on the 
part of the system to comply with the 
requirements (including monitoring re^ 
quirements) of this subpart. The supplier 
of water shall’give the notice required by 
this S 141.32 not less than mice every 
three months during the life of the non- 
cixnpliance: 

(1) By publication on not less than 
three consecutive days in a newspaper 
or newspapers of general circulatten 
serving the area served by such public 
water system, which newspaper or news¬ 
papers shall be wproved by the State. 
With respect to the public water sys¬ 
tems operated by Federal Agencies, the 
newspapers cited in this paragraph shall 
be an>roved by the Regional Administra¬ 
tor: 

' (2) By furnishing a copy ther^f to 
the radio and television stations serving 
such area as soon as practicable but not 
later than 36 hours after confirmation of 
the noncompliance with respect to which 
the notice is required; and 

(3) By inclusion with the water bills of 
the public water system at least once 
every three months if the water bills are 
issu^ at least once every three months, 
and with every water bill if they are is¬ 
sued less often. If water bills are not is¬ 
sued, other means of notification sw:cept- 
able to the State may be used. The notice 
required by this § 141.32 shall state at 
least that the public water system falls 
to monitor, operate the system or pro¬ 
vide water which meets all the require¬ 
ments of this subpart and shall state with 
particularity those requirements for 
which there is noncompliance. If a quan¬ 
titive limitation has been exceeded, the 
notice shall state what the Federal or 
State limitation is, and at what level of 
performance the water supply system has 
been operating. 

(b) 'nie supplier of water shall give 
notice pursuant to the procedures set 
forth in paragraph (a) of this section— 

(1) When his system has received a 
variance under section 1415(a)(1) or 
1415(a) (2) of the Act. and shall continue 
the notification process at no less than 
three month intervals during the life of 
the variance; 

(2) When his system has received an 
exemption under section 1416 and shall 
continue the notification process at no 
less than three month intervals during 
the life of the exemption; or 

(3) When his system has failed to 
comply with any schedule or control 
measure prescribed pursuant to a vari¬ 
ance or exemption and shall continue the 
notification process at no less than the 
three month intervals during the life of 
the variance and exemption. 

§141.41 Siting requirements. 

Before a person may enter into a 
financial commitment for or initiate 
construction of a new public water sys¬ 
tem or increase the capacity of an exist¬ 
ing public water system, he shall— 

(a) To the extent practicable, avoid 
locating part or sdl of the new or ex¬ 
panded facility at a site which: 

(1) Is subject to earthquakes, fioods, 
fires or other man-made disasters which 
could cause breakdown of the public 
water system or a portion thereof; and 

(2) Is within the floodplain of a 100 
year flood; 

(b) Notify the State. 

§ 141.51 EfTective date. 

The standards set forth in this sub¬ 
part shall take effect 18 months after 
the date of promulgation. 

(FRDOC.7S-6603 FUed 3-13-75:8:46 am] 
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