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EEPLY TO PRESIDENT LINCOLN'S LETTER.

To His Excellency Abraham Lincoln^

President of the United States :

Sir: Your answer, which has appear-

ed in the public prints, to the resohi-

tions adopted at a recent meeting in the

city of Albany, affirming the personal

rights and liberties of the citizens of this

comitry, has been refei'red to the mider-
signed—the Committee who prepared
and reported those resolutions. The sub-

ject will now reeeive from us some fur-

ther attention, which your answer seems
to justify, if not to invite. We hope
not to appear wanting in the respect due
to your high position, if we reply with a

freedom and earnestness suggested by
the infinite gravity and importance of

the questions upon which you have
thought proper to take issue at the bar
of public opinion.

You seem to be aware that the Con-
stitution of the United States, which you
have sworn to protect and defend, con-

tains the following guarantees to which
we again ask your attention : (l) Con-
gress shall nrake no law abridging the

freedom of speech or of the press. (2)

The right of tlie people to be secure in

their persons against unreasonable seiz-

ures,- f^hall not be violated, and no war-

rant shall issue but upon probable cause

supported by oath. (3) No person ex-

cept soldiers and mariners in the service

of the Government shall "be held to an-

swer for a capital or infamous crime, un-

less on presentment or indictment of a

grand jury, nor shall any person be de-

prived of life, liberty, or property with-

out due jDrocess of law. (4) In all crim-

inal prosecutions, the accused shall enjoy

the right of a speedy and public trial by
an impartial jury of the State or Dis-

trict in which the crime shall have been
committed, and to be confronted with
the. witnesses against him.

You are also, no doubt, aware that on
the adoption of the Constitution, these

invaluable provisions were proposed by
the jealous caution of the States, and
were inserted as amendments for a per-

petual assurance of liberty against the

encroachments of power. From your
earliest reading of history, you also know
that the great principles of liberty and

law which underlie these provisions were
derived to us from the British Constitu-

tion. In that country they were secured
by Magna Charta more than six hun-
dred years ago, and they have been con-

firmed by many and repeated statutes of
the realm. A single palpable violation

of them in England would not only
arouse the public indignation, but would
endanger the throne itself. For a per-

sistent disregard of them, Charles the
First was dethroned and beheaded by
his rebellious subjects.

The fiict has already passed into his-

tory, that the sacred rights and immuni-
ties which were designed to be protected
by these constitutional guarantees, have
not been preserved to the people during
your administration. In violation of the
first of them, the freedom of the press

has been denied. In repeated instances

newspapers have been suppressed in the

loyal States, because they criticised, as

constitutionally they might, those fatal

errors of policy which have character-

ized the conduct of public affairs since

your advent to power. In violation of

the second of them, hundreds and, we
believe, thousands of men, have been
seized and immured in prisons and bas-

tiles, not only without warrant upon
probable cause, but without any war-
rant, and for no other cause than a con-

stitutional exercise of freedom of speech.

In violation of all these guarantees, a
distinguished citizen of a peaceful and
loyal State has been torn from his home
at midnight by a band of soldiers, act-

ing under the order of one of your gen-

erals, tried before a military commission,
without judge or jury, convicted and
sentenced without even the suggestion

of any offense known to the Constitu-

tion or laws of this country. For all

these acts you avow yourself ultimately

responsible. In the special case of Mr.
Vallandigham, the injustice commenced
by your subordinate was consummated
by a sentence of exile from his home,
pronounced by you. That great wrong,
more than any other which preceded it,

asserts the principles of a supreme des-

potism.

These rejpeated and continued inva-
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sions of constitutional liberty and pri-

vate right, have occasioned profound

anxiety in the pubhc niitid. The appre-

hension and alarm which they are calcu-

lated to produce have been greatly en-

hanced by your attempt to justify ihem,

because in that attempt you assume to

yourself a rightful aulh.ority possessed

by no constitutional monarch on earth.

"We accept the declaration that you pre-

fer to exercise this authority with a mod-
eration not hitherto exhibited. But be-

lieving as we do, that your fv>rbearance

is not the tenure by wliich liberty is en-

joyed in this country, we propose to

challenge the grounds on which your
claim of supreme power is based. While
yielding to you as a constitutional ma-
gistrate the deference to which you are

entitled, we can not accord to you the

despotic power you claim, however in-

dulgent and gracious you may promise
to be in wielding it.

We have carefully considered the
grounds on which your pretensions to

more than regal authority ai;e claimed to

rest ; and if we do not misinterj^ret the

misty and clouded foi*ms of expression

in which those pretensions are set forth,

your meaning is, that while the riglits

of the citizen are protected by the Con-
stitution in time of peace, they are sus-

pended or lost in time of war, when in-

vasion or rebellion exist. You do not,

like many others in whose minds reason
and the love of regulated liberty seem
to be overthrown by the excitements of
the hour, attempt to base this conclusion

upon a supposed military necessity ex-

isting outside of and transcending the

Constitution, a military necessity behind
which the Consjtitution itself disappears

in a total eclipse. We do not find this

gigantic and monstrous heresy put forth

in your plea for absolute power, but we
do find another equally subversive of
liberty and law, and quite as certainly

tending to the establishment of despot-

ism. You claim to have found not out-

side, but Avithin the Constitution, a prin-

ciple or germ of arbitrary power, which
in time of war expands at once into an
absolute sovereignty, wielded by one
man ; so that liberty perishes, or is de-

pendent on his will, his discretion, or his

caprice. This extraordinary doctrine
you claim to derive wholly from that

clause of the Constitution whii'h,in case
of invasion or rebellion, permits the writ
of habeas corjms to be suspended. Upon
this ground your whole argument is

based.

You must permit us to say to you,
with all due respect, with the earnest-

ness demanded by the occasion, that the
American people will never acquiesce in

this doctrine. In their opinion the guar-
antees of the Constitution which secure

to them freedom of sjjeech and of the

])rcss, inununity from arrest for offenses

unknown to the laws of the land, and
the right of trial by jury before the tri-

bunals provided by those laws, instead

of military commissions and drum-head
courts-martial, are Tn-ing and vital prin-

ciples IN PEACE AND IX "VVAK, at all tiuiCS

and under all circumstances. No sophis-

try or argument can shake this convic-

tion, nor will the peo2:)le require its con-

firmation by logical sequences and de-

ductions. It is a conviction deeply in-

terwoven -with the instincts, the habits,

and the education of our covuitrymen.

The right to form opinions upon public

measures and men, and to declare those

opinions by speech or writing, with the

utmost latitude of expression ; the right

of personal liberty, unless forfeited ac-

cording to established laws, and for of-

fenses previously defined by law; the'

right, when accused of crime, to be tried

where law is administered, and punish-
ment is pronounced only when the crime
is legally ascertained—all these are rights

instantly perceived without argument or

proof No refinement of logic can un-
settle them in the minds of freemen ; no
power can annihilate them, and no force

at the cc^ranlaud of any chief magistrate
can compel their surrender.

So far as it is possible for us to under-
stand, from your language, the mental
process which has led you to the alarm-

ing conclusions indicated by your com-
munication, it is this: the habeas cor-

jms is a remedial writ, issued by courts

and magistrates, to inquire into the cause

of any imprisonment or restraint of lib-

erty ; on the return of which and upon
due e-xamination, the person imprisoned
is discharged, it' the restraint is unlaw-
ful, or admitted to bail if he appears to

have been lawfully arrested, and is held

to answer a criminal accusation. Inas-
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much as this process may be suspended
ill time of war, you seem to think that

every remedy for a false and unlawful im-

prisonment is abrogated ; and from this

postulate you reach, at a single bound,

the conclusion that there is no liberty

under the Constitution which does not

depend on the gracious indulgence of

thg Executive only. This great heresy

once established, and by this mode of

induction, there springs at once into ex-

istence a broo;d of crimes or offenses un-

defined by any rule, and hitherto im-

known to the laws of this counfriy ; and
this is followed by indiscriminate arrests,

midnight seizures, military commissions,

unheard-of modes of trial and punish-

ment, and all the machineiy of terror

and despotism. Your language does not

permit us to doubt as to your essential

meaning, for you tell us, that " arrests

are made not so much for what has been
done, as for \vhat probably would be
done." And, again :

" The man who
stands by and says m)thing when the

peril of his government is discusseil, can

not be misunderstood. If not hindered,

(of course by ari-est,) he is sure to help

the enemy, and much more if he talks

ambiguously, talks for his country with
'buts ' and ' ifs ' and ' auds.' " You also

tell us that the arrests complained of

liave -not been made "for the treason

defined in the Constitution," nor " for

any capital or otherwise infamous crimes,

nor were the proceedings following, in

any constitutional or legal sense, criminal

prosecutions." The very ground, then,

of your justification is, that the victims

of arbitrary arrest were obedient to

every law, were guiltless of any known
and defined, ofiense, and therefore were

without the protection of the Constitu

tion. The suspension of the writ of

habeas corpus, instead of being intended

to prevent the enlargement of arrested

criminals until a legal trial and convic-

tion can be had, is designed according

to your doctrine, to subject innocent

men to your supreme will and pleasure.

Silence itself is punishable according to

this extraordinary theory, and still more
so the expression of opinions, however
loyal, if attended with criticism upon the

policy of the Government. We must
respectfully refuse our assent to this the-

ory of constitutional lajv. We think

that men may be rightfully silent if

they so choose, while clamorous and
needy patriots proclaim the praises of
those who wield power; and as to the
"buts," the " ifs," and tlie " ands," these
are Saxon words, and belong to the yo-
cabulary of freemen.

We have already said that the intui-

tion of a free people instantly rejects

these dangefouS' and unheard-of doc-
trines. It is not our purpose to enter

upon an elaborate and extended refuta-

tion of them. We submit to you, how-
ever, one or two considerations, in the
hope that you will review the subject with
the earnest att-ention which its supreme
importance demands. We say, then, we
are not aware that the writ of habeas cor-

pus is now suspended in any of the peace-

ful and loyal States of tlie Union. An
act of Congress, approved'by you on the
third of March, 1863, authorized the

President to suspend it during the pres-

ent rebellion. That the suspension is

a legislative, and not an executive act,

has been hfeld in every judicial decision

ever made in this country, and we think

it can not be delegated to any other
brancli of the Government. But pass-

ing over that consideration, you have
not exercised the power which Congress
attempted to confer upon you, and the

writ is not suspended in any part of the

country where the civil laws are in force.

Now, inasmuch as your doctrine of the
arbitrary arrest and imprisonment of in-

nocent men, in admitted violation of
express constitutional guarantees, is

wholly derived from a suspension of the

habeas corpus, the first step^to be taken,

in the ascent to absolute power, ought
to be to make it known to the people
that the writ is in fact suspended, to the

end that they may know what is their

condition. You have not yet exercised

this power, and therefore, according to

your own constitutional thesis, your con-

clusion falls to the ground. It is one of

the provisions of the Constitution, and
of the very highest value, that no expost

facto law shall be passed the meaning
of which is, that no act which is not
against the law when committed, can be
made criminal bysubsequent legislation.

But your claim is, that when the writ of

habeas corpus is suspended, you may
lawfully imprison and punish for the
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crimes of silence, of speech, ami opinion.

But as these are not offenses against

the known and established law of the

hmdjtlie constitutional principle to which

"we now refer plainly requires that you
should, before taking: cognizance of such

offenses, make knowni the rule of a'ction,

in order that the people may be advised

in due season, so as not to become liable

to its penalties. Let us turn your at-

tention to the most glaring and inde-

fensible of all the assaults upon constitu-

tional liberty, which have marked the

history of your admiuisLi-ation. No one
has ever pretended that the writ of ha-

beas corpus was -suspended -in. the Static

of Ohio, where the arrest pf a citizen at

midnight, already referred to, was made,
and he placed before a military court-

martial for trial and sentence, upon
charges and specifications which admit-

ted his innocence according to the exist-

ing laws of this" country. Upon your
own doctrine, then, can you hesitate to

redress that monstrous wrong: ?

But, sn-, wo can not acquiesce in your
dognaas that arrests and imprisonment,
without warrant or criminal accusation,

in their nature lawless and arbitrary,

opposed to the very letter of constitu-

tional guarantees, can become in any
sense rightful, by reason of a suspension
of the writ oi habeas corpus. We deny
that the suspension of a single and pe-

culiar remedy for such wrongs brings
into existence new and unknown classes

of offenses, or new causes for depriving
men of their liberty. It is one of the
most material purposes of that writ, to

enlarge upon bail persons who, upon
probable cause, are duly and legally

charged with some known crime ; and a

suspension of the writ was never asked
for in England or in this country, except
to prevent such enlargement when the
supposed offense was against the safety

of the government. In the year 1807,
at the time of Burr's alleged conspiracy,

a bill was passed in the Senate of the
United States, suspending the writ of
habeas corpus for a limited time in all

cases where perso7is were charged on
oath icith treason or other high crime
or misdemeanor^ endangering the peace
or safety of the government. But your
doctrine undisguisedh'- is, that a suspen-
sion of this writ justifies arrests without

warrant, without oath, and even with-
out suspicion of treason or other crime.

Your doctrine denies the freedom of
speech and of the press ; it invades the
sacred domain of opinion and discus-

sion ; it denounces the "ifs" and the

"buts" of the English language, and
even the refuge of silence is insecure.

We repeat, a suspension of the writ

of habeas corpus merely dispenses with
a single and peculiar remedy against an
unlawful imprisonment ; but if that
remedy had never existed, the right to

liberty would be the same, and every
invasion of that right would be con-

demned not only by the Constitution,

buti. by ijrinciples of far greater anti-

quity than the writ itself Our com-
mon law is not At all indebted to this

writ for its action of false imprisonment,
and the action would remain to the citi-

zen if the writ were abolished forever.

Again, every man when his life or liber-

ty is threatened, without the warrant of
law, may lawfully resist, and if neces-

sary, in self-defense, may take the life

of the aggressor. Moreover, the people
of this country may demand the im-
peachment of the President himself for

the exercise of arbitrary power. And
when all these remedies shall ])rovc in-

adequate for the protection of free insti-

tutions, there remain^, in the last resort,

the supreme right of revolution. Yon
once announced this rirht with a lati-

tude of expression which may well be
considered dangerous in the present cri-

sis of our national history. You said

:

" Any people anywhere, being inclined

and having the power, have the right
to rise up and shake off the exislnio-

government, and form a new one that
suits them better. Nor is this right
confined to cases where the people of
an existing government may choose to
exercise it. Any portion of such people
that can may revolutionize and make
their own of so much of the territory

as they inhabit. More than this, a ma-
jority of any portion of such j^eople

may revolutionize, putting down a mi-
nority intermingled with or near about
them, who may oppose their move-
ments." (Vol. XIX., Congressloncd
Globe, p. 94.) Such were your opinions,

and you had a constitutional right to

declare them. If a citizen now should
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nttei' sentiments far less dangerous in

their tendency, your nearest military

cominander would consign him to a

dungeon, or to the tender mercies of a

court-martial, and you would approve
the proceeding.

In our deliberate judgment, the Con-
stitution is not open to the new inter-

pretation suggested by your communi-
cation now before us. We think every
part of that instrument is harmonious
and consistent. The possible suspen-

sion of the writ of habeas corpus is

consistent with freedom of speech and
of the press. The suspension of that

remedial process may prevent the en-

largement of the accused traitor or con-

spirator, until he shall be legally tried

and convicted or acquitted, but in this

Ave find no justification for ai*rest and
imprisonment without warrant, without
cause, without the accusation or sus-

picion of crime. It seems to us, more-
over, too plain for argument that the

sacred right of trial by jury, and in

courts where the law of the land is the

rule of decision, is a right which is never
dormant, never suspended, in peaceful

and loyal communities and States. Will
you, Mr. President, maintain, that be-

cause the writ of habeas corpus may be
in suspense, you can substitute soldiers

and bayonets for the peaceful operation

of the laws, military commissions and
inquisitorial modes of trial for the courts

and juries prescribed by the Constitution

itself? And if you can not maintain

this, then let us ask, where is the justifi-

cation for the monstrous proceeding in

the case of a citizen of Ohio, to which
we have called your attention ? We
know that a recreant judge, whose
name has already descended to merited

contempt, found the apology on the out-

side of the supreme and fundamental

law of the Constitution. Bnt this is

not the foundation on which your super-

structure of power is built.

We have mentioned the act of the

last Congress professing to authorize a

suspension of the writ of habeas cor-

pus. This act now demands your spe-

cial attention, because, if we are not

greatly in error, its terms and plain in-

tention are directly opposed to all the

arguments and conclusions of your com-
munication. That act, besides provid-

ing that the habeas corpus may be sus-

pended, expressly commands that the
names of all persons theretofore or
thereafter arrested by authority of the
President, or his cabinet ministers, be-

ing citizens of states in which the ad-
tninistration of the laws has contbmed
unimpaired., shall be returned to the
courts of the United States for the dis-

tricts in which such persons reside, or
in which, their supposed offenses were
committed ; and such return being made,
if the next- grand jury attending the
courts does not indict the alleged of-

fenders, then the judges are command-
ed to issue an order for their immediate
discharge from imprisonment. Now,
we can not help asking whether you
have overlooked this law, which most
assuredly you are bound to observe, or
whether it be your intention to disre-

gard it ? Its meaning certainly can not •

be mistaken. By it the national Legis-
lature has said that the President may
suspend the accustomed writ of habeas
corpus., but at the same time it has com-
manded that all arrests under his author-
ity shall be promptly made known to
the courts of justice, and that the ac-

cused parties shall be liberated, unless

presented by a grand jury according to

the Constitution, and tried by a jury in

the ancient and accustomed mode. The
President may possibly, so for as Con-
gress can give the right, arrest without
legal cause or warrant. We certainly

deny that Congress caii confer this

right, because it is forbidden by the
higher law of the Constitution. But,
waiving that consideration, this statute,

by its very terms, promptly removes
the proceeding in every case into the
com-ts where the safeguards' of liberty

are observed, and where the persons
detained are to be discharged, unless

indicted for criminal offe7ises against

the established and ascertained laws of

the country.

Upon what foundation, then, permit
us to ask, do you rest the pretension

that men who are not accused of crime
may be seized and imprisoned or ban-

ished at the will and pleasure of the
President or any of his subordinates in

civil and military positions ? Where is

the warrant for invading the freedom of

speech and of the press ? Where the
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justification for plncino; the citizen on

trini witliout the presentment of ;i pjriuid

jury and before military commissions?
Therk is xo power in this couxtry
u'hich can- dispexse with its laws.
Tlie President is as much hound hy
them as the humblest individual. We
pray you to bear in mind, in order that

you may duly estimate the feeling of

the people on this subject, that for the

crime of dispensing with the laws and
statutes of Great Britain, our ancestors

brought one monarch to the scaffold, and
expelled another from his throne.

This power whicli you have erected in

theory is of vast and illimilable propor-

tions. If we may trust you to exercise

it mercifully and leniently, your succes-

sor, whether immediate or more remote,

may wield it with the energy of a Caesar

or Xapoleon, and with the will of a des-

pot and a tyrant. It is a power without

boundary or limit, because it proceeds

upon a total suspension of all the consti-

tutional and legal safeguards which pro-

tect the rights of the citizen. It is a

power not inaptly described in the lan-

guage of one of your Secretaries. Said

Mr. Seward to the British Minister in

Washington :
" I can touch a bell on my

right hand, and order the arrest of a citi-

zen of Ohio. I can touch the bell again,

and order the imprisonment of a citizen of

New-York, and no power on earth but
that of the President can release them.
Can the Queen of England, in her domin-
ions, do as much ?" This is the very lan-

guage of a perfect despotism, and we
learn from you, with profound emotion,

that this is no idle boast. It is a des-

potism unlimited in principle, because
the same arbitrary and unrestrained will

or discretion which can place men under
illegal restraint or banish them, can ap-

ply the rack or the thumb-screw, can put
to torture or to death. Xot thus have
the people of this country hitherto un-

derstood their Constitution. No argu-

ment can commend to their judgment
such interpretations of the Great Char-
ter of their liberties. Quick as the light-

ning's flash, the intuitive sense of freemen
perceives the sophistry and rejects the
conclusion.

Some other mattei's which your Ex-
cellency has presented d'emand our no-
tice.

In jr.slification of your course ns to
]\[r. Vallandigham, you liave referred to

the arrest of Ju<lge T [all, at Xew-Or-
leans, by or«ler of General Jackson; but
that case differs widely from the case

of Mr. Vallandigham. Xew-Orleans was
then, as you truly state, under " martial

or military law." This w.as not so in

Ohio, where Mr. Vallandigham was ar-

rested. The administration of the civil

law had not been disturbed in that Com-
monwealth. The courts were open, and
justice was dis])ensed with its accusttnn-

ed promptitude. In the case of Judge
Hall, General Jackson in a few days sent

him outside of the line of his encamp-
ments and set him at liberty ; but you
have undertaken to bvanish Mr. Vallan-

digham front his home. You seem also

to have forgotten that General Jackson
submitted implicitly to the judgment of
the court which imposed the fine upon
hiai ; that he promptly paid it ; that he
enjoined his friends to assent, " as he
most freely did, to the decision which
had just been pronounced against him."

More than this, you overlook the fact

that the then administration (in the lan-

guage of a well-known author) " mildly

but decidedly rebuked the proceedings
of General Jackson," and that the Presi-

dent viewed the subject with " surprise

and solicitude." Unlike President Madi-
son, you, in a case much more unwarrant^

.

ed, approve the proceedings of your sub-

ordinate officer, and in addition, justify

your course by a carefully considered
argument in its support.

It is true that after some thirty years,

Congress, in consideration of the devoted
and patriotic services of General Jack-
son, refunded the amount of the fine he
had paid ! But the long delay in doing
this proved how reluctant the American
people were to do any thing which could
be considered as in any way approving
the disregard shown to the majesty of
the law, even by one who so eminently
enjoyed their confidence and regard.

One subject more, and we shall con-

clude. You express your .regret that

our meeting spoke "as Democrats," and
yoii say that " in this time of national

peril you would have preferred to meet
us upon a level, one step higher than
any party platform." You thus compel
us to allude to matters which we should
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have preferred to pass by. But we can
not omit to notice your criticism, as it

casts at least an implied reproach upon
our motives and our proceedings. We
beg to remind you that when the hour
of our country's peril had come; when it

"was evident that a most gigantic effort

was to be made to subvert our institutions

and to overthrow the Government; when
it was vitally important that party feel-:

ings should be laid aside, and that all

should be called upon to unite most cor-

dially and vigorously to maintain the

Union ; at the time you were sworn into

office as President of the United States,

when you should have urged your fellow-

citizens in the most emphatic manner to

overlook all past differences, and to rally

in defense of their country and its insti-

tutions ; when you should have enjoined

respect for the laws and the Constitution,

so clearly disregarded by the South—you
chose, for the first time under the like

circumstances in the history of our coun-

try, to set up a party platform, called
" the Chicago platform " as your creed,

to advance it beyond the Constitution,

and to speak disparagingly of that great

conservative tribunal of our country, so

highly respected by all thinking men
who have inquired into our institutions

^THE SUPKEJIE COUKT OF THE UnITED
States.
Your administration has been true to

the principles you then laid down, Not-
withstanding the fact that several hun-

dred thousand Democrats in the loyal

States cheerfully responded to the call

of their country, filled the ranks of its

armies, and by " their strong hands and
willing arms " aided to maintain your
Excellency and the oflicers of Govern-
ment in the possession of our national

capital—notwithstanding the fact that

the 'great body of the Democrats of

the country have, in the most patriotic

spirit, given their best efforts, their trea-

sure, their brothers and their sons to

sustain the Government and to put down
the rebellion, you, choosing to overlook

all this, have made your appointments to

civil office from your cabinet officers and
foreign ministers, down to the persons of

lowest official grade among the tens of

thousands engaged in collecting the re-

venues of the country, exclusively from
your political associates.

Under such circumstances, virtually
proscribed by your administration, and
while most of the leading journals which
supported it approved the sentence pro-
nounced against Mr. Vallandigham, it

was our true course, our honest course,
to meet as " Democrats," that neither
your Excellency nor the country might
mistake our antecedents or our position.

In closing this commimication, we de-
sire to reaffirm our determination, and,
we doubt not, that of every one who
attended the meeting which adopted the
resolutions we have discussed, expressed
in one of those resolutions, to devote
" all our energies to sustain the cause
of the Union."
Permit us, then, in this spirit, to ask

your Excellency to reexamine the grave
subjects we, have considered, to the end
that, on your retirement from the high
position you occupy, you may leave be-
hind you no doctrines and no further pre-
cedents of despotic power to prevent you
and your posterity from enjoying that
constitutional liberty which is the inherit-

ance of us all, and to the end, also, that
history may speak of your administra-
tion with indulgence, if it can not with
ajDproval.

We are, sir, Avith great respect, yours
very truly, John V. L. Prutn,

Chairmaii of Committee.

James Kidd,
Gilbert C. Davidsok,
J. V. P. QuACKENBUSH,
Wii. A. Fassbtt,
o. m. hungerfoed,
johjt hogan,
Hexrt La]s^sin-g,

S. Hakd,
M. K. Cohen,
John Cutler,
C. Van Benthutsen^,
George H. Thacher,
C. W. Armstrong,
William Doyle,
Franklin Townsend,
William Appleton,
B. R. Spelman,
James McKown,
A. H. Tremain,
Daniel Shaw,
W. Simon,
A. E. Stimson,
Isaac Lederee.

Albany, June 30, 1863.
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